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“And when they were come, and had gathered the church together, they rehearsed all that 
God had done with them, and how he had opened the door of faith unto the Gentiles.” 

Acts 14.27 

Furlough Report # 2 
   

     We’ve been able to get reacquainted with about 20 supporting churches, and also able 
to present our ministry to some new churches so far during our furlough.  We’ve been in 
3 states so far. Right now we are back in the El Paso area for about a month or so, but 
have been able to report to a couple churches in this area.  We’ve also been able to visit 
3 of the churches in Juarez while here.  It has been a blessing to see them moving ahead 
and growing without us. In fact, I believe they are doing better! 
 
     We plan to help celebrate the Quinceañera (15th Birthday) of Maria Rosa the youngest 
daughter of Brother Angel Luna who is pastor of the Maranatha Baptist Church in Juarez.  
We have been working with Brother Angel since Maria Rosa was just 2 years old.  I’ve 
been invited to give the biblical challenge to her to live her life in a way that pleases the 
Lord as she continues to adulthood. 
 
     We plan to be in Oklahoma, North Texas and Arkansas starting in mid-August through 
November.  Please let me know any churches that might consider us for support.  We 
need to raise some new support if possible.  One church has recently taken us on for 
support, and there is possibility of a couple more. Pray for our safety as we travel.  

 
Iglesia Bautista “Esperanza Mia” – Cd. Juárez, Chihuahua – Although this church has 
been struggling with consistent attendance and faithfulness of its members, Pastor 
DeAnda and this church continue reaching out to their area, and have seen some new 
people come to the Lord as result of their work.  Brother DeAnda’s son Jesus is attending 
a Bible Institute in preparation for the ministry.  Pray for him to continue faithful. 
 
Iglesia Bautista “Maranatha” – Cd. Juárez, Chihuahua – While visiting this church 
recently we were happy to see some of our faithful members of this church and several 
new members.  A new family that has recently moved to the area of the church and 
transferred their membership has really gotten involved. The husband has been helping 
brother Angel in soul winning and even filled in leading the music as needed.  It is a 
blessing to see them move ahead for the Lord.  Brother Angel is slowly getting better from 
his paralysis.  He has been standing behind the pulpit to preach during a recent service.  
Please continue praying for him as he desires to be able to walk again. 
 
Iglesia Bautista “Castillo Mío” – Cd. Juárez, Chihuahua – This church continues to 
show its maturity as they are reaching their community for the Lord as well as training and 
involving new leaders.  In fact, when we visited there a little over a week ago a man I had 
met one time before taught the Adult Sunday school class and did a good job.  Brother 
Manuel continues to attract and train new leaders in this work.  Vacation Bible School is 
scheduled for late July and they are busy preparing the leaders and teachers for this 
outreach ministry. Pray for them to stay faithful. 
      
 

        Looking for that Blessed Hope and Glorious Appearing!  
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